
Action on Pain  
 
Action on Pain provides advice and support to people living with pain and strives to raise the 
profile of pain among politicians, the NHS and health care professionals. 
Pfizer supported three of Action on Pain’s activities in 2010, including: 
 

• Social media training to aid participation in the European chronic pain health 
awareness campaign, ‘Can you feel my pain?’  

• Funding for attendance at two advisory board meetings on development of European 
advocacy campaigns on chronic health. 

• Funding for attendance at a meeting of executive committee of partners in European 
advocacy campaign, the ‘Pain Proposal’. 

• A specific pain awareness project using the charity’s outreach ‘Mobile Information 
unit’ to give one to one support and advice on living with pain to event visitors. 

€2,700 (£2,251) 
 
As a guide this amount represents 7.6 % of the organisation’s total income based on their last 
reported financial year (October 2008 - September 2009). 
 
 
Age Concern Banstead  
  
Age Concern Banstead is an independent registered charity working in Banstead and the 
surrounding area that forms part of the Reigate and Banstead Borough to the north of the 
M25.The districts covered comprise of Banstead Village, Burgh Heath, Chipstead, part of 
Hooley, Kingswood, Lower Kingswood, Mogador, Nork, Tadworth, Tattenham Corner, 
Walton-on-the-Hill and Woodmansterne. 

They aim to promote the well-being of all older people and help make their life a fulfilling and 
enjoyable experience. 

Pfizer supported Age Concern Banstead as a charity local to Pfizer’s head office with a 
donation in lieu of sending corporate Christmas cards and provided basic photocopying 
services as a gift in kind. 
  
£500 
  
As a guide this amount represents less than 1% of the organisation’s total income based on 
their last reported financial year (January 2009 - December 2009). 
 
 
Age Concern Herne Bay  
  
Age Concern Herne Bay aims are to promote the relief of elderly people in any manner which 
now or hereafter may be deemed by law to be charitable within the county of Kent with 
particular reference to Herne Bay and District.  
 
Pfizer’s donation contributed towards a Christmas party for Age Concern Herne Bay 
volunteers. 
 
£500 
 
As a guide this amount represents less than 1% of the total income of Age Concern Herne 
Bay based on their last reported financial year (April 2009 - March 2010) 
 
 
 
 



Alzheimer's Society  
 
Alzheimer’s Society is the leading support and research charity for people with dementia, their 
families and carers. They provide information, education, support and care to help people with 
dementia live their lives to the full. Alzheimer’s Society also invests over £6 million in 
dementia research to improve the lives of people today and to find a cure for tomorrow. 
 
Alzheimer’s Society delivered training to Pfizer and also received a donation following 
colleague fundraising.  Pfizer also provided basic photocopying services and transport as a 
gift in kind to the Epsom branch of the Alzheimer’s Society, as well as a donation in lieu of 
sending corporate Christmas cards in 2010.  Finally, Pfizer delivered the Judith Fox 
Photography exhibition in association with Alzheimer’s Society. 
 
£2,063.50 
 
As a guide this amount represents less than 1% of the total income of Alzheimer's Society 
based on their last reported financial year (April 2009 - March 2010). 
 
 
Amy and friends  
 
Amy & Friends facilitates the support of children and families suffering from Cockayne 
Syndrome (CS) in the UK. The charity organises meetings for group members to share 
experiences and knowledge to gain support from each other, and assist families in taking part 
in CS research programmes.   
 
Pfizer’s donation supported an annual retreat weekend for the children and families that Amy 
and Friend’s supports. 
 
£1,000 
 
As a guide this amount represents less than 3% of the organisation’s total income based on 
their last reported financial year (January 2009 - December 2009). 
 
 
Anxiety UK  
 
Anxiety UK works to support people living with anxiety disorders by providing information, 
support and understanding through its range of services. 
 

• Pfizer purchased from Anxiety UK 100 leaflets on Generalised Anxiety Disorder. 
 

• Pfizer granted to Anxiety UK a non-exclusive, irrevocable, worldwide, perpetual 
licence to use and reproduce a Pfizer-owned survey of 557 sufferers of GAD and 
excessive anxiety dated April 2009. 

 
£460 
 
As a guide this amount represents less than 1% of the total income of Anxiety UK based on 
their last reported financial year (January 2009 - December 2009). 
 

Arthritis and Musculoskeletal Alliance (ARMA)  

ARMA is the umbrella body providing a collective voice for the arthritis and musculoskeletal 
community in the UK. Together, ARMA and its member organisations work to improve quality 
of life for more than 9.6 million people in the UK with these conditions. ARMA has 35 member 
organisations representing a broad range of interests across service user, professional and 
research groups working in the field of musculoskeletal conditions. 
  



During 2010 Pfizer provided ARMA with two core funding payments, one of which was 
outstanding from 2009. Pfizer provided funding to ARMA to support specific government 
affairs activities including the ARMA political meetings programme. 
In order to support ARMA to hold a better understanding of the work undertaken by Pfizer, an 
invitation was extended to Sarah Rich, ARMA colleague to participate within a work 
placement day. 
  
ARMA is an umbrella organisation and during 2010, Pfizer made a one-off charitable donation 
to ARMA Dorset to support local meetings. 
  
£23,500  
  
As a guide this amount represents 13.86% of the organisation’s total income based on their 
last reported financial year (January 2009 - December 2009). 
 
 
Arthritis Care  
 
Arthritis Care exists to support people with arthritis. Arthritis Care is the UK’s largest charity 
working with and for all people who have arthritis. It is a user led charity which means people 
with arthritis are at the heart of all its work – forming its membership, influencing and 
engaging in all of its activities and directing strategy by electing the board of trustees, the 
majority of whom, though board members by dint of their skills and expertise, are themselves 
people with arthritis. 
During 2010 Arthritis Care participated within the European Pain Proposal activities 
developed by Pfizer. Neil Betteridge, CEO, attended the Pain Proposal Executive Committee 
meeting as a representative of the UK. An honorarium was paid. Additionally, Arthritis Care 
attended the launch of the European Pain Proposal launch which was hosted in the European 
Parliament in September 2010. Travel and accommodation was provided to facilitate this 
attendance. 
Pfizer also provided support to Arthritis Care NI’s Health Professional Lecture, Stormont in 
June 2010. The event helped raise the profile of arthritis and other musculoskeletal conditions 
on the health agenda in Northern Ireland, particularly the issue of staying in and returning to 
employment.  
 
€1,700 & £425  
 
As a guide, this amount represents less than 0.02 % of the organisation’s total income based 
on their last reported financial year (January 2009 - December 2009). 
 
 
ASH Wales  

ASH Wales is the leading voluntary organisation in Wales tackling tobacco use. Our main aim 
is to achieve a reduction in and eventual elimination of the health problems associated with 
tobacco use. 
 
 
Pfizer provided support to ASH Wales towards the cost of the ASH Wales Conference in 2009 
and 2010. 
  
£7,600  
 
As a guide this amount represents less than 3% of the organisations total income based on 
their last reported financial year (April 2009 - March 2010). 
 
 
 
 



Back Care  
 
BackCare, the charity for healthier backs, is the only charity in the UK totally dedicated to 
providing support for, and campaigning on behalf of, people whose life is significantly affected 
by back pain.  
 
Pfizer provided a donation to BackCare to support the development of their iPhone 
application. 
 
£12,500  
 
As a guide this amount represents 3.2% of the organisation’s total income based on their last 
reported financial year (January 2009 - December 2009). 
 
 
Beating Bowel Cancer  

Beating Bowel Cancer works to save lives by raising awareness of symptoms promoting early 
diagnosis and helping to improve access to treatment for people affected by this cancer. 

Pfizer provided Beating Bowel Cancer with funding for a liver metastases campaign that 
aimed to improve care for patients with advanced disease.  

 £5,000 

As a guide this amount represents less than 0.5% of the total income of Beating Bowel 
Cancer based on their last reported financial year (April 2009 - March 2010). 
 
 
Bladder and Bowel Foundation  
 
The Bladder and Bowel Foundation is the UK’s leading charity providing information and 
support for people with bladder and bowel disorders, their carers, families and healthcare 
professionals.  

Pfizer supported the charity as a Platinum Member. 

£9,995  
 
As a guide this amount represents 3.6% of the organisation’s total income based on their last 
reported financial year (April 2009 - March 2010).  
 
 
Bowel Cancer UK  
 
Bowel Cancer UK aims to save lives by raising awareness of bowel cancer, campaigning for 
best treatment and care and providing practical support and advice. 
 
Pfizer provided funding to support the charity’s general patient support for bowel cancer which 
spans advice, information, emotional support, knowledge and awareness of the condition. 
 
£5,000 
 
As a guide this amount represents less than 0.4% of the charity’s total income based on their 
last reported financial year (January - December 2010) 
 
 
 
 



Breakthrough Breast Cancer  
 
Breakthrough Breast Cancer is pioneering charity saving lives and changing futures, through 
research, campaigning and education – removing the fear of breast cancer for good.  
 
Our support went towards the charity's organisation of the Westminster Fly-In, which is a 2 
day lobbying and training event for people affected by breast cancer to enable them to gain 
the necessary skills and opportunity to talk to their MP directly about their experiences of 
breast cancer treatment, research and services.  
Pfizer is also a supporter of the charity’s Triple Negative breast cancer research conference. 
 
£30,000  
 
As a guide this amount represents less than 0.1% of the total income of Breakthrough Breast 
Cancer based on their last reported financial year (August 2008 - July 2009). 
 
 
Breast Cancer Care  
 
Breast Cancer Care provides information, practical assistance and emotional support for 
anyone affected by breast cancer.  
 

• Pfizer and Breast Cancer Care jointly planned, organised and resourced a media 
think tank to better understand the reasons why journalists do not commonly cover 
stories about secondary breast cancer.  

 
• Pfizer also invited one of the charity’s nurses to share experiences, common issues 

and best practice in metastatic breast cancer at a Pfizer Europe patient advocacy 
dialogue meeting. Pfizer paid standard travel and accommodation expenses for the 
charity’s nurse to attend the meeting and provided a gift in kind – digital photos from 
the meeting - for their own use.   

 
• Pfizer engaged one of the charity’s specialist nurse as a paid speaker on survivorship 

at a Pfizer organised nurse education meeting. 
 
£750 
 
As a guide this amount represents 0.1% of the total income of Breast Cancer Care based on 
their last reported financial year (April 2009 - March 2010). 
 
 
Breast Cancer Haven  
 
Breast Cancer Haven helps people through the experience of breast cancer. The charity 
offers information, emotional support and complementary therapies in three welcoming 
centres.  The charity also runs an outreach programme for people who are unable to get to a 
centre. 
 
Breast Cancer Haven received a donation following a quiz at a Pfizer educational meeting. 
 
£300 
 
As a guide this amount represents less than 0.1% of the charity’s total income based on their 
last reported financial year (April 2009 - May 2010). 
 
 
 
 
 
 



British Lung Foundation  
 
The British Lung Foundation exists to help people with lung disease. It does this by raising 
money to provide services to people with lung disease and their families, to fund scientific 
research for better treatments and cures and by campaigning for change to improve lung 
health in the UK.  The services provided include Breathe Easy support groups, BLF nurses, 
BLF active and the helpline. 
 
Pfizer part sponsored the Love your Lungs tester events hosted by the British Lung 
Foundation and also supported the Breathe Easy support group in Thanet, to help them 
develop four newsletters for the local area.  Added to this, Pfizer has worked in partnership 
with the British Lung Foundation to raise awareness of Pneumococcal Disease as members 
of the PneumoAware group. Finally, Pfizer also delivered a series of workshops to the British 
Lung Foundation Services team. 
 
£11,600 
 
As a guide this amount represents less than 1% of the total income based on their last 
reported financial year (April 2009 - March 2010). 
 
 
Cancer Campaigning Group  
 
The Cancer Campaigning Group (CCG) is an independent coalition of over 40 national cancer 
charities representing service providers, research, advocacy and campaigning groups for 
cancer patients and their families. The CCG’s aim is to improve cancer policy and services 
across the four areas of prevention, care and treatment, patient involvement and choice, and 
research. Supporting organisations do not direct or control CCG strategy, activities or 
literature in any way. 
 
Pfizer has supported the costs associated with the running of the Cancer Campaigning 
Group.  The payment was made to MHP who manage the secretariat for the CCG. 
 
£15,000 
 
As a guide this amount represents 25% of the total income of the Cancer Campaigning Group 
based on their last financial year (2009 - 2010). 
 
 
Cancer Research UK  
  
Cancer Research UK (CRUK) exists to protect and promote the health of the public through 
its research into the nature, causes, diagnosis, prevention, treatment and cure of all forms of 
cancer.   
  
Pfizer made a payment to CRUK as the account holder for the National Cancer Research 
Initiative (NCRI) Secretariat, to support a lung cancer clinical studies meeting.  We also paid 
£130 in travel expenses to a CRUK professor who attended as an independent speaker at 
Pfizer’s annual Cancer Agenda meeting. 
  
£6,130 
  
As a guide this amount represents 0.1% of the charity’s total income based on their last 
reported financial year (April 2009 - March 2010). 
 
 
 
 
 
 



Connect  
 
Connect – The Communication Disability Network is a charity which supports people living 
with aphasia, a communication disability which occurs after stroke. Aphasia is sometimes 
known as dysphasia and it can also be caused by brain injury or tumour. Connect aims to 
improve the lives of people living with aphasia, equipping them to re-connect with life.  
 
Pifzer provided funding towards the development and printing of Connect’s Annual Report  
 
£4,000  
 
As a guide this amount represents less than 1% of the organisation’s total income based on 
their last reported financial year (April 2009 - March 2010). 
 
 
Dementia UK  
 
Dementia UK aims to improve the quality of life for all people affected by the various forms of 
dementia.  It fulfils those aims through the provision of admiral nurses in partnership with NHS 
trusts to help those caring for people with dementia in their own homes. Dementia UK also 
provides training for professionals, and it also runs a support network for family carers. 
 
Dementia UK provided training to Pfizer colleagues at an internal conference and also 
received a donation as the nominated charity of the Communiqué awards.  
 
£10,000 
 
As a guide this amount represents less than 1% of their total income based on their last 
reported financial year (April 2009 - March 2010). 
 
 
Diabetes UK  
 
Diabetes UK provides practical support and information to help people manage their diabetes. 
The organisation campaigns for better standards of care and funds research into better 
treatments for diabetes. Through these types of activities Diabetes UK aims to improve the 
lives of people with diabetes.  
  
Pfizer supported the Diabetes UK Annual Professional Conference, and Diabetes UK 
provided consultancy on Pfizer's ChoLESSterol campaign. 
  
£63,503.98* 
  
*£24,525 of this total was applicable to Diabetes UK's consultancy on the Pfizer Life website 
and a Pfizer payment for a stand at a Diabetes UK Healthcare Professional meeting, both of 
which took place during Pfizer's 2009 fiscal year (1st December 2008 - 30th November 2009) 
and were disclosed in 2009 
 
As a guide this amount represents less than 1% of the organisation’s total income based on 
their last reported financial year (January 2009 - December 2009). 
 
 
Dial Kent for the Disabled  
 
Dial Kent is a free, impartial and confidential service of information, advice and in some 
cases, practical help for the disabled people of Kent.  The service is run by volunteers most of 
whom are themselves disabled. Dial Kent's service is open to anyone with a query or problem 
related to disability issues. 
 



Pfizer’s donation supported the charity to enable them to continue to provide their essential 
service to disabled people living in Kent and will help towards the wheelchair loan service 
costs. 
 
£500 
 
As a guide this amount represents less than 3% of the total income of Dial Kent based on 
their last reported financial year (February 2009 - January 2010). 
 
 
Dyscover  
 
Dyscover is a charity providing long-term support and opportunities to people with aphasia, a 
communication disability caused by stroke or other brain injury. Daily sessions are led by 
professional speech and language therapists from two centres in Surrey, designed to develop 
strategies for communicating, maximise abilities and offer help and support for carers and 
families. 
 
Pfizer made a payment to reimburse Dyscover for equipment used to decorate Dyscover’s 
offices, as part of a Pfizer Health Relief project. 
 
£223.18 
 
As a guide this amount represents less than 1% of the organisation’s total income based on 
their last reported financial year (April 2009 - March 2010). 
 
 
Family Action  
 
Family Action is a National Charity of which the Whitstable and Herne Bay Family Support 
Services are a part.  They provide support to families with young children in the Canterbury 
and Coastal District including post natal depression groups for new Mum’s. 
 
Pfizer’s donation to support a volunteer peer mentors project.  Training will be provided and 
include listening skills, boundaries, role of peer supporters, child protection, the effects of 
PND on children, stress management.  The groups will provide information and support for 
people with PND and activities including therapeutic massage, exercise and art activities. 
 
£9,974 
 
As a guide this amount represents less than 1% of the total income of Family Action based on 
their last reported financial year (April 2009 - March 2010). 
 
 
Family Planning Association  
 
Sexual health charity FPA works to establish a society in which everyone has positive, 
informed and non-judgmental attitudes to sex and relationships; where everyone can make 
informed choices about sex, relationships and reproduction so that they can enjoy sexual 
health free from prejudice or harm. 
 
Pfizer gave a donation to support the core functions of the organisation. 
 
£1000 
 
As a guide this amount represents 0.02% of the organisation’s total income based on their 
reported last financial year (April 2009 - March 2010). 
 
 
 



GIST Support UK  
 
GIST Support UK provides information, support and education for patients with Gastro-
Intestinal Stromal Tumours (GIST) a rare form of cancer. 
 
The charity also supports their carers and works closely with health care professionals to 
promote awareness, better diagnosis and treatment of GIST. 
 
Pfizer’s support contributed to the costs of running the charity's patient conference.  Pfizer 
also provided the charity with an opportunity to raise awareness of their patient support work 
with healthcare professionals at our GIST management study day. 
 
£5,000 
 
GIST Support UK is a relatively new charity and has no published accounts, but the donation 
represents about 16% of their income. 
 
 
Headway Dorset  
 
Headway Dorset is an independent voluntary organisation affiliated to Headway UK, the Brain 
Injury Association. Headway Dorset provides a comprehensive, needs led service throughout 
Dorset, promotes wider understanding of brain injury, and provides information, advice and 
support to people with brain injuries, their families and carers. 
 
Pfizer made a payment to reimburse Headway Dorset for materials used as part of a Pfizer 
Health Relief project at the Headway Centre. 
 
£246.66 
 
As a guide this amount represents less than 1% of the organisation’s total income based on 
their last reported financial year (April 2009 - March 2010). 
 
 
Headway East Kent  
 
Headway East Kent is an independent voluntary organisation affiliated to Headway UK, the 
Brain Injury Association. Headway provides advice, support and care for those who have 
sustained a severe head injury, their families and carers. 
 
Pfizer Sandwich provided funding towards the cost of large screen laptops for Headway East 
Kent’s day care centres, and two lightweight wheelchairs. 
 
£1,600 
 
As a guide this amount represents less than 1% of the organisation’s total income based on 
their last reported financial year (January 2009 - December 2009). 
 
 
HEART UK – The Cholesterol Charity  
 
HEART UK supports those at risk of premature cardiovascular disease (CVD) due to raised 
cholesterol, especially those with inherited high cholesterol. The charity provides information 
to patients and their families, campaigns for better detection of CVD risk factors and supports 
research and health professional training. Through these types of activities, HEART UK 
strives to prevent premature deaths associated with high cholesterol and CVD. 
 
HEART UK received funding for consultancy on, and was a partner of, Pfizer’s ChoLESSterol 
campaign. Pfizer also provided support for the HEART UK Annual Conference and made a 
payment towards a cardiovascular product assessment.  



 
£20,507* 
 
*£5,000 of this total was applicable to HEART UK’s consultancy on and partnership of Pfizer’s 
ChoLESSterol campaign, which took place during Pfizer’s 2009 fiscal year (1st December 
2008 – 30th November 2009) and was previously disclosed in 2009. 
 
As a guide this amount represents approximately 2% of the total income of HEART UK based 
on their last reported financial year (March 2009 - February 2010). 
 
 
James Whale Fund for Kidney Cancer  
 
The James Whale Fund is the UK’s leading specialist kidney cancer charity. It seeks to help 
reduce the harm caused by kidney cancer by increasing knowledge and awareness, providing 
patient information and by supporting research into the causes, prevention and treatment of 
the disease. 
  
Pfizer made a donation to support the Fund’s patient support network activities and 
contributed to the costs of running a patient conference.  We also funded the revision of their 
patient information booklet about kidney cancer patient and supported the charity’s renal 
nurse study day in Wales. 
  
£22,110 
  
As a guide this amount represents approximately 3.5% of the total income of James Whale 
Fund for Kidney Cancer based on their last reported financial year (October 2009 - 
September 2010). 
 
 
Kent Autistic Trust  
 
Kent Autistic Trust aims to develop specialised living services and day vocational/life skill 
opportunities for people with autism spectrum condition whatever their need. They provide 
support and advocacy services for people with ASC and their families and carers in Medway 
& Kent, and work with people to understand what they want and to stimulate local services to 
meet their needs. 
 
Pfizer supported the charity with a donation towards the cost of furniture for the Asperger 
Social Skills Group.  
 
£600 
 
As a guide this amount represents less than 1% of the total income of Kent Autistic Trust 
based on their last reported financial year (April 2009 - March 2010). 
 
 
Macmillan Cancer Support  
 
Macmillan Cancer Support improves the lives of people affected by cancer. Macmillan are a 
source of support:  providing practical, medical, emotional and financial support. Macmillan 
are a force for change: listening to people affected by cancer and working together for better 
cancer care. 
  
Pfizer supported the annual Britain Against Cancer Conference, which Macmillan runs on 
behalf of the All Party Parliamentary Group on Cancer. Pfizer also engaged Macmillan as 
working group members for our annual Cancer Agenda meeting.  Pfizer made a donation to 
Macmillan’s Cancer Support and Volunteering Project in Kent and donated the proceeds of a 
cake sale and participation in Macmillan’s World’s Biggest Coffee Morning. 
  



£15,206.79* 
 
 *£350 of this total was applicable to participation in Pfizer’s Cancer Agenda meeting which 
took place during Pfizer’s 2009 fiscal year (1st December 2008 - 30th November 2009) and 
was disclosed in 2009. 
  
As a guide this amount represents less than 0.1% of the total income of Macmillan Cancer 
Support based on their last reported financial year (January - December 2009). 
 
 
Marie Curie Cancer Care  
 
Marie Curie Cancer Care is a national charity that is dedicated to the care of people with 
terminal cancer and other illnesses. 
 
Pfizer paid Marie Curie Cancer Care to provide a chairperson for a Pfizer meeting on 
Palliative Care and Sleep, held in October 2010, for health care professionals. Pfizer also 
paid Marie Curie Cancer Care for a stand at a clinical meeting on palliative care, held in 
December 2009. 
 
£670  
 
As a guide this amount represents less than 1% of the organisation's total income based on 
their last financial year (April 2009 - March 2010). 
 
 
MASH (Medway Asthma Self-Help)  
 
Medway Asthma Self Help (MASH) is committed to making information about Asthma 
available to all people in Medway. It also provides access to professional help for people with 
Asthma and their carers in Medway. It works closely with local health providers and other 
community organisations. 
 
Pfizer provided a donation towards funding of 3 months salaries for the clinic nurse, clinic co-
ordinator and fundraising officer for the local community group. 
 
£1,000 
 
As a guide this amount represents 4.46% of the total income of Medway Asthma Self Help 
based on their last reported financial year (October 2009 - September 2010). 
 
 
Meningitis Research Foundation  
 
Meningitis Research Foundation funds research to prevent meningitis and septicaemia, and 
to improve survival rates and outcomes. The charity carries out an information and 
educational programme for the public and health professionals to reduce death and disability, 
and offers befriending support and membership of the charity to people affected. 
 
Pfizer provided a core funding donation as well as support for the development of the 
Meningitis Research Foundation’s ‘Counting the Cost’ project.  Pfizer also supported the 
‘Regional Meningitis Day’ conference in 2009 and the ‘Meningitis Symposium’ in 2010. 
 Finally, Pfizer made an initial payment towards the costs of the ‘Meningitis Research 
Foundation Conference’ in 2011. 
 
£51,500 
 
As a guide this amount represents 2.1% of the organisation’s total income based on their last 
reported financial year (April 2009 - March 2010). 
 



Meningitis Trust  
 
The Meningitis Trust provides ongoing practical & emotional support to families & individuals 
through a unique range of free services, including a 24-hour nurse helpline, financial support 
grants, counselling, art therapy, home visits, family days & community support. It is committed 
to raising awareness of meningitis & produces & distributes millions of leaflets, posters & 
symptom cards every year. 
 
Pfizer provided a core funding donation to the Meningitis Trust as well as support for the 
development of a Meningitis signs and symptoms iPhone App.  Pfizer also supported the 
‘After Effects Conference’, developed by the Meningitis Trust, and a donation following 
colleague fundraising. 
 
£37,750 
 
As a guide this amount represents 1.2% of the organisation’s total income based on their last 
reported financial year (April 2009 - March 2010). 
 
 
Men's Health Forum  
 
Men’s Health Forum’s mission is to provide an independent and authoritative voice for male 
health and to tackle the inequalities affecting the health and well-being of boys and men in 
England and Wales. It is an independent charity that works in partnership with a wide range of 
individuals and organisations to tackle this problem. 
 
Pfizer provided funding to Men’s Health Forum towards printing and production of a sexual 
health mini-manual and the development costs of Men’s Health Week 2011. Men’s Health 
Forum provided consultancy on, and was a partner of, Pfizer’s Man MOT project.  
 
£12,000 
 
As a guide, this amount represents approximately 1.3% of the total income of Men’s Health 
Forum based on their last reported financial year (April 2009 - March 2010). 
 
 
Men’s Health Forum Scotland  
 
Men's Health Forum Scotland is a registered charity which aims to improve the health and 
wellbeing of men and boys in Scotland.  
 
Pfizer placed awareness raising adverts on smoking cessation, and diabetes and cholesterol, 
in a Men’s Health Forum Scotland publication. 
  
£1,400 
  
As a guide this amount represents less than 1% of the organisation’s total income based on 
their last reported financial year (April 2009 - March 2010). 
  
 
Motor Neurone Disease Association  
 
The MND Association is the only national charity in England, Wales and Northern Ireland that 
funds and promotes global research into Motor Neurone disease and provides support for 
people affected by MND.   
  
Pfizer supported the Motor Neurone Disease Association as a charity local to Pfizer’s head 
office with a donation in lieu of sending corporate Christmas cards 
  
£500 



   
 As a guide this amount represents less than 1.0% of the organisation’s total income based 
on their last reported financial year (June 2008 - July 2009). 
 
 
National Ankylosing Spondylitis 
 
The National Ankylosing Spondylitis Society (NASS) is the only registered charity dedicated 
to the needs of people affected by ankylosing spondylitis (AS) in the UK. Since 1976 NASS 
has played a crucial role in providing accurate and up to date information allowing people with 
AS to have a greater understanding of their disease and in turn, make more informed choices 
in the management of their symptoms. 
 
During 2010, Pfizer provided support to NASS in brokering meetings with Public Health Wales 
to promote ‘Looking Ahead’. No funding was paid to NASS during 2010 
 
 
National Autistic Society South Kent Branch  
 
The NAS Shepway Branch provides a point of communication and information for parents, 
families and carers of children with ASD. Regular monthly meetings are arranged with 
refreshments and a speaker to allow parents and carers to meet and discuss autism related 
subjects. There is also a Family Fun Club once a month which allows the whole family to get 
involved with fun, stimulating and healthy activities such as arts, crafts, sports and games, as 
well as an opportunity to enjoy regular day trips and social gatherings in the school holidays. 
 
Pfizer provided funding for therapy sessions for Parent/Carers of children with Autism for one 
year.  
 
£1,740 
 
As a guide this amount represents less than 1% of the total income of National Autistic 
Society based on their last reported financial year (April 2009 - March 2010). 
 
 
National Centre for Young People with Epilepsy  

The National Centre for Young People with Epilepsy (NCYPE) is the UK’s only epilepsy 
charity solely dedicated to changing the lives of children and young people with epilepsy. We 
have over 100 years’ experience in the education, treatment and care of young people with 
the condition. 

• Pfizer reimbursed the NCYPE for material used at a Health Relief Day. 
• Pfizer made a donation to NCYPE in lieu of sending corporate Christmas Cards  

 
£672.64 
 
As a guide this amount represents less than 1.0% of the organisation’s total income based on 
their last reported financial year (June 2008 - July 2009). 
 
 
National Concern for Healthcare Infection (NCHI)  

NCHI is a registered charity whose aims are to inform, support and represent the interests & 
safety of patients, their families and all individuals affected by issues of patient safety and 
healthcare associated infections. NCHI’s objectives are to promote patient safety, public 
health and the saving of lives. NCHI works in collaboration with all the relevant government 
departments and other agencies to address all issues surrounding healthcare.   



• Pfizer engaged the NCHI to act as an independent speaker on patient centred care. 
• Pfizer engaged the NCHI as experts as part of an anti-infectives advisory boards to 

develop care pathway for patients being discharged from hospital. 
 
£2,346.20 
 
As a guide this amount represents 38% of the organisation’s total income based on their last 
reported financial year (February 2009 - January 2010). 
 
 
National Rheumatoid Arthritis Society (NRAS) 
 
The National Rheumatoid Arthritis Society (NRAS) provides support and information for 
people with Rheumatoid Arthritis and Juvenile Idiopathic Arthritis, their families, friends and 
carers, and health professionals with an interest in Rheumatoid Arthritis. During 2010 Pfizer 
worked with NRAS on a number of activities which are detailed below: 
 

• Rheumatoid Arthritis ‘Learn & Lunch’, an internal Pfizer activity designed to raise 
awareness levels of RA amongst Pfizer colleagues. NRAS were invited to host a 
stand at Walton Oaks, Pfizer and Ailsa Bosworth, NRAS CEO presented the ‘patient 
perspective’ during the internal meeting. Pfizer printed a banner stand for NRAS to 
use during the event and for other events attended by NRAS. No funding was 
provided for this activity. 
 

• Patient Advisory Board: Pfizer invited NRAS to participate within its patient advisory 
board to better understand the RA patient perspective of the Enbrel patient pack. An 
honorarium and travel expenses was paid to the representative from NRAS for their 
participation within this meeting.  

 
• Consultancy Support: Pfizer undertook a focus group with NRAS Members to 

evaluate the development of the Pfizer patient retention programme. Pfizer agreed to 
pay NRAS to cover the costs associated with this meeting.  

 
• NRAS supported the Pfizer ‘Can You Feel My Pain?’ UK Road-show as a campaign 

partner. No funding was provided for this activity. 
 

• Devolved Nations Activity: Pfizer provided funding to NRAS to support its government 
affairs work in the devolved administrations.  

                                                                                                                                                     
                        

£12,131.98 
 
Registered as a charity on 11 March 2010 therefore no accounts available until April 2011.  
 
 
National Voices  
 
National Voices is the national, independent voice of patients, service users and their 
representatives, and acts as the umbrella for health and social care charities in England.  
National organisations of all sizes are members of National Voices, representing millions of 
people, and covering a diverse range of health conditions and communities. 
 
Pfizer supported the development of the National Voices 'No decision about me without me: 
making it real’ conference, in September 2010. 
 
£25,000 
 
As a guide this amount represents 5.4% of the organisation’s total income based on their last 
reported financial year (January - December 2010). 
 



NET Patient Foundation  
 
The NET Patient Foundation (incorporating Living with Carcinoid) is a small specialist rarer 
cancer charity that provides education and support for patients, families and healthcare 
professionals affected by, or working within this cancer field. 
 
Pfizer provided a donation to support the charity’s helpline and also contributed funding for a 
pilot community NET nurse seeking to improve care for NET patients. 
 
£35,000 
 
As a guide this amount represents 35% of the charity’s total income based on their last 
reported financial year (August 2008 - September 2009). 
 
 
Pain Association Scotland  
 
Pain Association Scotland provides self-management training, advice and education for 
people suffering directly or indirectly from any form of chronic painful condition.  
 
Pfizer paid Pain Association Scotland to provide a speaker at an educational meeting for 
health care professionals, organised by Pfizer in Lanarkshire, on the subject of management 
of chronic pain. 
  
£150 
  
As a guide this amount represents around 0.07 % of the organisation’s total income based on 
their last reported financial year (April 2009 - March 2010). 
 
 
Pain Relief Foundation  
 
The Pain Relief Foundation was established in response to the need for specialised research 
into the causes and treatment of chronic pain in humans. The charity aims to carry out 
research leading to the alleviation of chronic pain, to find improved methods of treating 
chronic pain, to disseminate the results of such research throughout the world and to work in 
co-operation with the NHS and universities to provide post-graduate scientific education in 
chronic pain relief. 
 
Pfizer supported the Pain Relief Foundation website and funded printing of information 
leaflets. Pfizer paid to have stands at four educational meetings on chronic pain, organised by 
the Pain Relief Foundation for medical professionals. 
 
£2,350 
 
As a guide this amount represents 0.6% of the organisation’s total income based on their last 
reported financial year (April 2009 - April 2010). 
 
 
Pamela Northcott Fund  
 
Pfizer supported The Pamela Northcott Fund to provide direct advocacy work on individual 
appeals for non-NICE approved cancer treatments, and for the development of a 
commissioning manifesto. 
 
£12,000 
 
As a guide this amount represents 15% of the organisation’s total annual income. 
 
 



Parkinson’s UK - Thanet Branch  
 
The Thanet Branch of Parkinson’s disease Society offers information, friendship and local 
support to people with Parkinson’s, their families and carers to ensure that no one has to face 
Parkinson’s alone.  Many members are confined to wheelchairs and most have mobility 
problems. The Thanet branch meets weekly and provides seated exercise, reflexology and 
massage sessions carried out by qualified instructors. 
 
Pfizer’s donation is towards the costs of sessions with the Holistic Therapist and outings for 
the members, most of whom are unable to drive. 
 
£2,000 
 
As a guide this amount represents less than 16.75% of the total income of Thanet Branch of 
Parkinson’s UK based on their last reported financial year (January 2009 - December 2009). 
 
 
Patients Association  

The Patients Association is a national charity providing patients with an opportunity to raise 
concerns and share experiences of healthcare. 

Pfizer provides core funding to the Patients Association via an annual membership.  We also 
supported the charity’s server upgrade, development of patient materials for local trusts and 
contributed to the costs of the charity’s participation in the Health Hotel at party conference. 

£14,000 

As a guide this amount represents 4% of the organisation’s total income based on their last 
reported financial year (January - December 2009). 
 
 
PHA UK  
 
PHA UK strives to advance the education of the general public in the condition known as 
Pulmonary Hypertension through the provision of information and educational resources for 
sufferers, their families, careers and members of the medical profession.  
 
Pfizer supported a PHA UK led 2 day educational event for Nurses and Pharmacists.  
 
£7,500  
 
As a guide this amount represents less than 1% of the organisations total income based on 
their last reported financial year (May 2008 - April 2009) 
 
 
Pituitary Foundation  
 
The Pituitary Foundation is a national support, information and advocacy organisation for 
pituitary patients, their families, friends and carers.  The Foundation operates throughout the 
UK and the Republic of Ireland. 
 
Pfizer provided core funding in the form of a benefactorship donation. 
 
Pfizer engaged the charity as experts to take part in an advisory board to gain insights on 
patient experiences of diagnosis and choice. 
 
 
£16,500 



 
As a guide this amount represents less than 5% of the organisation’s total income based on 
their last reported financial year (July 2008 – June 2009). 
 
 
Prader-Willi Syndrome Association UK  
 
The Prader-Willi Syndrome Association are a registered charity, and the only organisation in 
the UK which is dedicated to supporting people with Prader-Willi syndrome (PWS), their 
families, carers, and the professionals who work with them. 
 
Pfizer engaged the charity as experts to take part in an advisory board to gain insights on 
patient experiences of diagnosis and choice. 
 
£500 
 
As a guide this amount represents less than 1% of the organisation’s total income based on 
their last reported financial year (April 2009 - March 2010). 
 
 
Prostate Cancer Support Association Kent  
 
Prostate Cancer Support Association Kent provides support and information for all those 
affected by prostate cancer in Kent. 
 
Pfizer supported the production of a prostate cancer booklet and emergency WC cards. 
 
£220 
 
As a guide this amount represents 1% of the organisation’s total income based on their last 
reported financial year (January 2009 - December 2009). 
 
 
Psoriasis Scotland Arthritis Link Volunteers (PSALV) 

PSALV was launched in early 2004. It is a Scottish charity that is founded by people with skin 
psoriasis and PsA, supporting the needs of people with these conditions in Scotland.  

During 2010, Pfizer worked in partnership with PSALV to develop a Parliamentary working 
dinner designed to support the launch of the SIGN guidelines in Psoriasis and Psoriatic 
Arthritis. The event was held November 2010 in the Members Dining Room of the Scottish 
Parliament and hosted by Dave Thompson MSP and other members of the CPG PSALV 
employed an agency, Jim Eadie Consulting Ltd to assist them administer the event.  

£8,000  

As a guide this amount represents 38% of the organisations total income based on their last 
reported financial year (April 2009 - March 2010). 

 
Rarer Cancers Foundation  
 
The Rarer Cancers Foundation’s (RCF) mission is to ensure that people with rarer cancers 
have access to the best services and outcomes. They raise awareness for people affected by 
rare or less common cancers, focused and inspired by the needs of patients and their 
families. 
 



The RCF’s public policy programme is set out to encourage recognition of the specific issues 
facing people with rare and less common forms of cancers and the difficulties faced by 
clinicians and patients to gain access to the most appropriate forms of treatment.   
 
Pfizer supported the charity’s conference that explored the issue of ageism and cancer 
treatment and provided speaker fees for a presentation at Pfizer’s Cancer Agenda advisory 
board meeting. 
 
£5,350 
 
As a guide this amount funded represents approximately 2% of the total income of the 
organisation based on their last reported financial year (March 2009 – April 2010). 
 
 
Raynaud’s & Scleroderma Association (RSA) 
  
The Raynaud’s & Scleroderma Association (RSA) work to provide educational and emotional 
support for Raynaud's and scleroderma patients and their families. The Association is 
committed to increasing awareness of these conditions and raising money for essential 
research in order to determine the cause, enhance treatment and ultimately find a cure. 
  
Pfizer supported the production of the ‘Hot News’ newsletter (4 editions) and reprint costs of 
patient information leaflets. 
  
£14,500  
 
As a guide, this amount represents approximately 2% of the organisations total income based 
on their last reported financial year (January 2009 - December 2009). 
 
 
Relate East Kent 
 
Relate East Kent provide counselling services to people in Kent. This includes family 
counselling, relationship counselling, teen counselling and sex therapy.  
 
Pfizer Sandwich provided funding towards a new client appointment and management system 
for Relate East Kent.  
 
£5,000 
 
As a guide, this amount represents approximately 2% of the total income of the Relate East 
Kent based on their last reported financial year (April 2009 - March 2010). 
 
 
The Royal National Institute of Blind people (RNIB) 
  
The RNIB is the UK's leading charity working in sight loss prevention, offering information, 
support and advice to almost two million people with sight loss.  Their work targets those at 
risk of sight loss and anyone with sight problems - not just with braille and talking books, but 
with imaginative and practical solutions to everyday challenges and innovative sight loss 
prevention activities. 
  
Pfizer provided support to the RNIB towards the cost of the Vision 2020 Conference 2010. 
 
Pfizer also supported the meetings of the Glaucoma Alliance Wales for which the RNIB 
Cymru provides the secretariat.   
 
Pfizer also utilised the Braille transcription service offered by RNIB for patient information 
leaflets. 
 



£12,628  
 
As a guide this amount represents less than 1% of the organisations overall funding based on 
their last reported financial year (ending 31 March 2010). 
 
 
Roy Castle Lung Cancer Foundation  
 
The Roy Castle Lung Cancer Foundation is the only charity in the UK wholly dedicated to 
defeating lung cancer, the biggest cancer killer in the world.  
 
Pfizer made a donation to support a campaign seeking to incentivise earlier diagnosis of lung 
cancer, particularly in patients who are at higher risk.  Pfizer also engaged the charity to 
facilitate at our annual Cancer Agenda meeting and consulted with them via an advisory 
board.   
 
£5,250  
 
As a guide, this total represents less than 0.5% of the total income of the Roy Castle Lung 
Cancer Foundation, based on their last reported financial year (January - December 2009). 
 
 
Samaritans  
 
Samaritans provides completely confidential emotional support 24 hours a day by telephone, 
personal visit, email, text and letter, through its branch network - support that includes 
outreach activity at festivals and outside our centres in prisons, hospitals, schools, the 
workplace and with homeless people. 
  
Pfizer provided a donation to support the provision of training to volunteers to enable the 
delivery of the ‘Referral Programme’. 
  
£4,000 
  
As a guide this amount represents less than 1% of the total income based on their last 
reported financial year (April 2009 - March 2010). 
 
 
Sarcoma UK  

Sarcoma UK provides information and support for sarcoma patients in the UK, as well as 
education for health professionals working with sarcomas. 

In 2010 we supported Sarcoma UK to organise the annual educational conference for the 
British Sarcoma Group - healthcare professionals who specialise in the care and treatment of 
patients with a sarcoma.  Pfizer also engaged Sarcoma UK’s Director to Chair our annual 
Cancer Agenda meeting. 

£9,500 

As a guide the donation to Sarcoma UK's own work represents about 4.2% of the direct 
income of Sarcoma UK based on their last reported financial year. The donation for the BSG 
Conference, managed by Sarcoma UK, represented 13% of the event's income.  

 
Scleroderma Society  
 
The Scleroderma Society works to provide help and support for people with scleroderma, 
increase awareness of scleroderma and fund scientific and medical research in the area. 



 
Pfizer supported the redesign and reprint costs of patient information leaflets. 
 
£1,000 
 
As a guide this amount represents 1% of the organisation’s total income based on their last 
reported financial year (April 2009 - March 2010). 
 
 
Scottish Dementia Working Group  
 
The Scottish Dementia Working Group (SDWG) is an independent organisation working 
under the umbrella of Alzheimer Scotland.  The Working Group campaigns to improve 
services for people with dementia and to improve attitudes towards people with dementia. 
 
Pfizer supported the SDWG to attend the Dementia Services Development Centre 
international dementia conference for patients in London. 
 
£1,000 
 
As a guide this amount represents less than 1% of the total income of Alzheimer Scotland 
based on their last reported financial year (April 2009 - March 2010). 
 
 
Seeability  
 
SeeAbility supports adults who are blind or partially sighted and have other multiple 
disabilities including; learning, physical and mental health disabilities, acquired brain injuries 
and degenerative conditions, to explore their potential and enhance their quality of life. They 
currently provide services in Devon, East Sussex, Hampshire, Somerset and Surrey. 
 
Pfizer supported SeeAbility as a charity local to Pfizer’s head office with a donation in lieu of 
sending corporate Christmas cards. 
 
£500 
 
As a guide this amount represents less than 1% of the organisation’s total income based on 
their last reported financial year (February 2009 - January 2010). 
 
 
Sexual Advice Association  

The Sexual Advice Association (formerly the Sexual Dysfunction Association) is a charitable 
organisation to help sufferers of male and female sexual problems and their partners and to 
raise awareness of the extent to which sexual conditions affect the general population.  

Pfizer provided funding towards The Sexual Advice Association’s patient helpline and e-mail 
response service. The Sexual Advice Association provided consultancy to, and was a partner 
of, Pfizer’s Man MOT project.  
 
£15,000 

As a guide this amount represents 20% of the organisation’s total income based on their last 
reported financial year (January 2009 - December 2009).  

 

 



Specialised Healthcare Alliance 

The Specialised Healthcare Alliance (SHCA) is a broad coalition of patient groups.  The 
SHCA campaigns on behalf of people with rare diseases and other complex conditions which 
require specialised medical care. Examples are numerous but include certain cancers, cystic 
fibrosis, haemophilia, neurological conditions and a wide range of services for children.  
 
Pfizer paid for 

• Internal colleagues’ attendance at the SHCA conference in 2010.  
• Core funding donation to support the organisations ongoing activities.  
• Funding to support SHCA’s QIPP project. 

 
£16,176.26 
 
As a guide this amount represents 10% of the organisation’s total income based on their last 
reported financial year (December 2009 - November 2010). 
 
 
Shepway Autism Support Group  
 
Shepway Autism Support Group is a newly formed local community group that has been set 
up to improve and provide activities for children on the Autism Spectrum and their parents 
and carers within the Shepway area.   
 
Pfizer provided a donation towards running a weekly youth group for teenagers with autism 
and a monthly funclub for younger children with autism, also towards holiday projects for 
2011. 
 
£750 
 
As a guide this amount will represent approximately 10% of the total income of Shepway 
Autism Support Group based on this year’s financial year (Jan 2011 – Dec 2011). 
 
 
Tobacco Control Collaborating Centre  

The Tobacco Control Collaborating Centre (TCCC) aims to contribute to the development of a 
skilled and effective tobacco control workforce through the provision of an authoritative source 
of advice, information and resources for those working in this field.  

TCCC also strives to increase appropriate tobacco control activity and capacity in developing 
relevant practices in alliance with local government, non governmental organisations and 
other sectors of the economy. 

Pfizer made a donation to the TCCC towards their innovative programme to turn University 
Hospital Coventry and Warwickshire smoke free. 
 
£12,000  
 
As a guide, this amount represents 3% of the organisations total income based on their last 
reported financial year (August 2009 - July 2010). 
 
 
The Stroke Association  
 
The Stroke Association is the only UK wide charity solely concerned with combating stroke in 
people of all ages. It funds research into prevention, treatment and better methods of 
rehabilitation, and helps stroke patients and their families directly through its Life After Stroke 
Services. The Stroke Association also campaigns, educates and informs to increase 



knowledge of stroke at all levels of society, and acts as a voice for everyone affected by 
stroke. 
  
The Stroke Association partnered with Pfizer on the ChoLESSterol campaign, providing 
editorial input.  
  
£6,000 
  
As a guide, this amount represents less than 1% of the total income of the Stroke Association 
based on their last reported financial year (April 2009 - March 2010). 
 
 
The Teenage Cancer Trust  
 
Teenage Cancer Trust raises money for the provision of specialist units that cater for the 
needs of young people with cancer, related professional services, education and research. 
 
Pfizer made a donation to the Teenage Cancer Trust when a speaker waived his fee at our 
annual Cancer Agenda meeting.   
 
£500 
 
As a guide this amount represents less than  0.1% of the total income of Teenage Cancer 
Trust based on their last reported financial year (July 2009 - June 2010). 

 
Transplant Sport UK  
 
Transplant Sport UK raises awareness of the need for organ donation in the UK and 
worldwide.  The charity organise sports and social events for transplant recipients, and 
demonstrates the benefits of organ donation in enabling people to lead normal and active 
lives after transplantation. 
 
Pfizer contributed to the British Transplant Games, a multi-sport event for recipients of a life 
saving organ transplant. 
 
£1,000 
 
As a guide this amount represents 0.2% of the organisation’s total income based on their last 
financial year (April 2009 - March 2010). 
 
 
Trigeminal Neuralgia Association UK 
 
The Trigeminal Neuralgia Association offers support and encouragement to TN patients, their 
families and friends, and provides information on treatments available. It also raises 
awareness amongst medical professionals, particularly GPs and dentists, regarding diagnosis 
and treatment. 
 
Pfizer supported the production of information leaflets on Trigeminal Neuralgia. 
 
£2800 
 
As a guide, this amount represents 5.6% of the organisation’s total income based on their last 
financial year (April 2009 - March 2010). 
 
 
 



Turner Syndrome Support Society  
 
The Turner Syndrome Support Society is a national charity caring for the needs of those with 
Turner Syndrome throughout the United Kingdom. The Society offers support and information 
to both girls and adult women with Turner Syndrome, their families and friends. 
 
Pfizer provided TSSS with core funding through a benefactor payment. Pfizer engaged the 
charity as experts to take part in an advisory board to gain insights on patient experiences of 
diagnosis and choice. 
 
£10,500 
 
As a guide, this amount represents 11% of the organisation’s total income based on their last 
financial year (January 2009 - December 2009). 
 
 
Ulster Cancer Foundation  
  
Ulster Cancer Foundation funds research into new treatments for cancer and undertakes 
education programmes to help people reduce their risk of developing cancer. 
  
Pfizer supported the Ulster Cancer Foundation with funding towards a No Smoking Day 
Briefing event.  
 
£1,000  
 
As a guide, this amount represents less than 1% of the organisation’s total income based on 
their last reported financial year (August 2009 - July 2010). 
 
 
United Kingdom Lung Cancer Coalition (UKLCC)  
 
The United Kingdom Lung Cancer Coalition (UKLCC) is a partnership of charities, clinicians, 
senior NHS professionals and healthcare companies with a commitment to double lung 
cancer survival. It is the nation’s only multi-interest group in lung cancer. The UKLCC is 
primarily a campaigning organisation.  
 
Pfizer provided membership funding to belong to the UKLCC and contribute to its activities. 
 
£5,000 
 
As a guide this amount represents between 7.7% of the organisation’s total income based on 
their last reported financial year (January - December 2010). 
 
 
Wellbeing of Women  
 
Wellbeing of Women raises money to invest in medical research and the development of 
specialist doctors and midwives working in the field of reproductive and gynaecological 
health. 
 
In agreement with Wellbeing of Women, Pfizer produced a leaflet designed for patients with 
overactive bladder using Pfizer medicines, which featured the Wellbeing of Women logo. 
Pfizer also sponsored stand space at a consumer health day organised by Wellbeing of 
Women to raise awareness of women’s health issues. 
 
£12,000 
 
As a guide this amount represents 0.7% of the organisation’s total income based on their last 
reported financial year (January 2009 - December 2009). 



Patient groups working across Europe 
 
During 2009 Pfizer also worked with European-focused patient groups which are based in the 
UK. These are detailed below. This support is also detailed on www.Pfizer.eu.  
 
 
European Federation of Neurological Associations  
 
The European Federation of Neurological Associations (EFNA) brings together European 
umbrella organisations of neurological patient advocacy groups, to work with other 
associations in the field of neurology, in what has been termed a ‘Partnership for Progress’. 
EFNA engages in activities, which contribute to the advancement of neurology and related 
areas with a view to improving the quality of life of people living with neurological conditions, 
their families and carers. 
 
Pfizer International Operations provided the following funding to the European Federation of 
Neurological Associations to support activities during 2010. 

 
• To support the organisation core activities 
 
• As secretariat to the emerging EU Pain Alliance. The funding was provided to enable 

ENFA to initiate activities which would enable the EU Pain Alliance to establish its 
organisational structure and develop its membership. 

 
• To support the development of EFNA’s Health Technology Assessment tool kit.  

 
• EFNA joined the Can You Feel My Pain? EU Health Awareness Campaign as a 

formal partner during 2010. The campaign will feature on the EFNA Website in April 
2011. In order to facilitate this activity Pfizer will provide ENFA will social media 
training (provided by Creation Healthcare). There is no funding associated with this 
activity. 

 
• EFNA’s president participated within a series of Pfizer activities during 2010 as 

follows: 
o Pain Proposal: EFNA’s President participated as a steering committee 

member to the Pain Proposal for which an honorarium with 
travel/accommodation was paid. 

o Can You Feel My Pain, EU Health Awareness Campaign: EFNA’s President 
chaired the Pfizer European Advisory Board meetings during 2010, a group 
of patient advocacy groups and citizen organisations who worked with Pfizer 
to develop the Can You Feel My Pain, EU Health Awareness Campaign, for 
which an honorarium and travel was paid for both meetings.  

o EFNA’s President featured in a film produced by Pfizer which was used for 
internal purposes only for which travel expenses were paid.  

 
€53,000  
 

      As a guide this represents 10.7% of the organisation’s last reported financial year. 
 
 
European Gauchers Alliance  
 
The EGA is an umbrella organization that supports and represents the national Gaucher 
associations on a pan-european level. It has provided patient focussed guidance, support and 
advice to industry, healthcare providers, governments, the EU, developing patient 
organisations, scientists and physicians and all other stakeholders in the Gaucher 
Community.  
 
Pfizer International Operations provided funding to European Gaucher Alliance to support its 
core activities in 2010. 



€15,000.00 
 

As a guide this represents 30% of the organisation’s last reported financial year. 
 
 
European Parkinson’s Disease Associations  
 
The European Parkinson’s Disease Association (EPDA) is the only European umbrella 
organisation for Parkinson’s disease.  A non-political, non-religious, and non-profit making 
organisation, it represents 45 member organisations and is the advocate for the rights and 
needs of over 1.2 million people with Parkinson’s and their families. EPDA’s vision is to 
enable a full life with Parkinson’s whilst supporting the search for a cure and seeks to achieve 
this by raising awareness and reducing inequalities in the treatment and management of 
Parkinson’s disease across Europe. (www.epda.eu.com)  
 
EPDA joined the Can You Feel My Pain? EU Health Awareness Campaign as a formal 
partner during 2010. The campaign will feature on the EPDA Website in April 2011. In order 
to facilitate this activity Pfizer will provide EPDA with social media training (provided by 
Creation Healthcare). There is no funding associated with this activity. 
 
 
QUIT 
 
Within Europe, Pfizer has partnered with QUIT in their role as lead agency for the European 
Network of Quitlines, an initiative aimed at maximising collaboration between those European 
countries providing quitline services. European based partnership activities were: 
 

• Sponsorship of the annual conference for the European Network of Quitlines.  
 
• Support towards the costs of attendance at the WTOH meeting in 2009 for a member 

of the QUIT organisation.  
 
£220,319* 
 
*A payment of USD 258,096 (£159,319 - exchange rate as of 20th Sept 2009) was made in 
2010 towards the delivery of a Social Exclusion Project designed to improve smoking 
cessation rates which was previously disclosed in 2009. 
 
As a guide this amount represents approximately 11.6% of the total income of QUIT based on 
their last reported financial year (April 2008 - March 2009). 
 
 
Pfizer UK Foundation 
 
As a healthcare company Pfizer is committed to helping people live healthier lives through our 
community investment programmes. 

 
The Pfizer UK Foundation is a grant scheme dedicated to providing short-term funding and 
support for projects tackling health inequalities arising from social, economic, cultural and 
demographic factors in deprived areas and marginalised communities. 

 
We provide funding and support to community groups, charities, patient groups, the NHS and 
local authorities to deliver projects which provide tailored, innovative and local solutions to 
needs defined by local healthcare experts, social care experts, community groups and 
charities in areas where local issues cannot be met purely through statutory provision.   
 
 
Here are the patient groups who were recipients of a Pfizer UK Foundation grant between 1 
December 2009 and 30 November 2010. 
 



 
Action for Sick Children (Scotland) (ASCS) 
 
Action for Sick Children (Scotland) is the only charity in Scotland dedicated to informing, 
promoting and campaigning on behalf of the needs of all sick children and young people 
within their healthcare system.  During 2010 they were awarded a grant of £20,652 from the 
Pfizer UK Foundation to deliver ‘The Special Smiles’ project to address the dental health of 
children and young people with additional and complex support needs in Glasgow, through 
the delivery of specialised play and educational resources. 
 
 
Asthma UK 
 
Asthma UK is dedicated to improving the health and well-being of people in the UK whose 
lives are affected by asthma.  During 2010 they were awarded a grant of £49,437 from the 
Pfizer UK Foundation to deliver a project to address the health inequality experienced by 
adults and children with asthma in Liverpool. 
 
The project will deliver an integrated approach to care provision for children with asthma, and 
deliver lay training to adults with asthma to enable them to run awareness sessions for other 
adults with the condition.  
 
 
CanRehab 
 
CanRehab provides cancer rehabilitation seminars, workshops and training programmes in 
the UK. They offer educational and professional support to anyone wishing to develop 
exercise based rehabilitation programmes for cancer patients.  During 2010 the Pfizer UK 
Foundation awarded a grant of £40,176 to deliver the ‘Active ABC’ project to provide a 
programme of safe, tailored and accessible group exercise programmes for all identified 
women in their first year post breast cancer diagnosis in Glasgow, specifically targeting those 
most in need and living in deprived areas.  
 
 
British Lung Foundation 
 
The British Lung Foundation exists to help people with lung disease. It does this by raising 
money to provide services to people with lung disease and their families, to fund scientific 
research for better treatments and cures and by campaigning for change to improve lung 
health in the UK.  During 2010 they were awarded a grant of £32,810 to deliver a project to 
combat the high incidence of COPD in the Sandwell PCT area. Through a targeted approach 
the project would provide information messages and raise awareness of lung disease 
amongst employers, as well as offering health checks at awareness-raising events in 
workplace settings. 
 
 
Highland Community Care Forum 
 
Highland Community Care Forum (HCCF) has over the past 20 years built up a portfolio of 
services for carers including young carers, people with mental health problems, people with 
learning and physical disabilities and older people. HCCF adopts a community development 
approach and works in remote, rural and urban localities across the Highland area.   During 
2010 they were awarded a grant of £27,741 from the Pfizer UK Foundation to deliver a health 
promotion project which would identify and support young carers in Lochaber by delivering 
interactive awareness sessions in schools, establishing support networks and activities and 
signposting/partnering with existing local youth groups.  
 
 
 
 



Marie Curie Cancer Care 
 
Marie Curie Cancer Care is a national charity that helps people affected by cancer, their 
families and carers.  During 2010 they were awarded a grant of £50,000 from the Pfizer UK 
Foundation to deliver a project that would address the health inequalities that exist in deprived 
boroughs of London for people who are carers of terminally ill patients. The project aimed to 
coordinate and improve access to existing services, working directly with carers to ensure that 
their needs were being met. 
 
RNIB Cymru 
 
The RNIB is the UK's leading charity working in sight loss prevention, offering information, 
support and advice to almost two million people with sight loss.  Their work targets those at 
risk of sight loss and anyone with sight problems - not just with braille and talking books, but 
with imaginative and practical solutions to everyday challenges and innovative sight loss 
prevention activities.  During 2010 RNIB Cymru were awarded a grant of £43,079 from the 
Pfizer UK Foundation to deliver a project working with and consulting low income 
communities.  The project aimed to identify barriers to regular eye health checks through the 
distribution of targeted information, partnership focus group work and delivery of face to face 
eye health messages. 
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